Thomas Fritzel

From: Trip Frizell <TFrizell@Polsinelii.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2014 3:56 PM
To: Thomas Fritzel

Subject: FW: bliss sports Il

Here you go.

From: Margaretha Broxton

Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2014 3:53 PM
To; Kim Ashurst

Cc: Trip Frizeli

Subject: RE: bliss sports II

Total billed to date on 071381-443927 is $212,535.81

Open Invoices
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